

**Proposal Form  
RFP # 1918  
Grocery Products For  
The Food Service Department**

Return original Response to RFP to:

Mt. Diablo Unified School District  
Purchasing Department  
2326 Bisso Lane, Concord, California 94520

- Unit prices shall be F.O.B. Destination or for the service rendered.
- Vendor shall honor RFP prices for ninety (90) days or for the stated contract period, whichever is longer.
- **Proposals due on Tuesday, August 2, 2022 at 10:00 a.m.**

**Documents to be submitted to make the RFP Proposal Packet:**

- Proposal Form & Service Level Agreement
- Price Sheet
- Renewal Option
- Non-Collusion Declaration
- Bidder's Statement Regarding Insurance Coverage
- Criminal Background Investigation/fingerprinting Certification
- Worker's Compensation Insurance Certificate
- Tobacco-Free Environment Certification
- Drug Free Workplace
- Equal Employment Opportunity Compliance Certificate

**Bidder hereby acknowledges receipt of *Addenda Number(s)* \_\_\_\_\_, \_\_\_\_\_, and \_\_\_\_\_.**

## Service Level Agreement

### PURPOSE

The Mt. Diablo Unified School District is seeking competitive quotes to provide district-wide Grocery Products delivery service.

### OBJECTIVE

The Mt. Diablo Unified School District desires to enter into a twelve-month contract for District Wide Grocery Products Delivery services. The vendor shall provide all labor, materials, and necessary appurtenances to perform delivery at the various MT. DIABLO UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT sites listed herein for the period of August 29, 2022 to June 30, 2023. With possible 3 one-year extensions, for a possible total contract term of 4 years.

### BACKGROUND

The Mt. Diablo Unified School District is a K-12 public school district located in Concord, California serving the educational needs of over 29,000 K-12 students. The District covers over 150 square miles, including the cities of Concord, Pleasant Hill, Clayton; portions of Walnut Creek, Martinez, and unincorporated areas including Lafayette, Pacheco, Pittsburg, and Bay Point. Mt. Diablo Unified School District is one of the largest school districts in the State of California, with over 50 school sites and programs.

#### The District has:

High schools – 5,  
Continuation High School - 1  
Middle Schools – 9  
Elementary Schools – 28  
Special Education Schools – 2  
Adult Education Centers - 2  
Central Kitchen – 1  
Central Food Warehouse - 1

### SCOPE OF WORK

The vendor will deliver to identified sites Grocery Products as identified in this document. The Grocery Products must be delivered in a clean and sanitary truck. A lift gate and pallets may be needed for large loads.

### AGREEMENT

Below are the details of the service expectations from the successful Bidder upon receiving the award for this RFP. Successful Bidder must understand and agree to the following levels of service if they are to enter into an agreement with Mt. Diablo Unified School District. It is very important that the Bidder understands that the District's Grocery Products RFP not only includes the purchase of products, but includes service/delivery expectations that must be agreed to prior to entering into this agreement.

This is a one (1) year RFP with the possibility of three (3), one (1) year extensions. This RFP Agreement will be from August 29, 2022 thru June 30, 2023.

1. All Grocery Products specified will be purchased from the successful Bidder select. The District reserves the right to add or remove products as necessary due to school demand.

2. This proposal is for a one, two, or three times a week delivery.
3. District will provide start up amounts of products. Bidder will then gauge product usage and supply products as needed.
4. District will contact Bidder if additional product is needed. District will not be responsible for calling in numbers and codes.
5. Bidder submitting a RFP shall specify product size, case count, and tie height pallet specifications. Containers must be sealed, labeled with product name, shelf life/best if used by date and storage requirements. Bidder shall include Product Formulation Sheets, Nutritional Analysis and Ingredients list which must be acceptable to the Food & Nutrition Services Department. District will require/request a sample case for taste testing to evaluate for taste, texture, overall quality of product, appeal and consistency and nutritional value.
6. **All Grocery Products shall meet Food & Nutrition standards (EAT REAL Undesirable Ingredients List [Appendix A] set by the District Food Department.**
7. Advanced approval by Food and Nutrition Services Department must be obtained prior to substitutions being made. Items substituted must be priced as the same as the item the District would normally receive.
8. Quarterly, the successful Bidder shall submit a complete listing with usages of all products purchased by the District.
9. All invoices and statements shall be sent to: Mount Diablo Unified School District, 1936 Carlotta Drive, Concord, CA 94519 Attention: Food and Nutrition Services.
10. The District reserves the right to add or delete product; increase or decrease amounts; add or delete site locations.
11. Failure to meet these specifications shall entitle the District to cancel the contract with 30 day notice.

#### **Central Food Warehouse & Central Kitchen Delivery**

1. All Grocery Products which are damaged, crushed or questionable will be refused or shall be replaced immediately upon notification.
2. Bidder shall arrange a predetermined time for deliveries to the Central Food Warehouse

by contacting the warehouse Supervisor at 925-682-8000, ext. 3770 and for Central Kitchen contact Lead Worker at 925-687-8524.

3. Bidder All Grocery Products pallets are to be picked up at the time of the next delivery.
4. All delivery tickets must be signed for by the authorized Supervisor or Warehouse Lead Worker on site. If the site Food Service Lead Worker is unavailable, a signature must be obtained from the Food Service office staff. Missed deliveries and/or shortages of delivery are unacceptable.
5. The vendor will deliver to identified sites Grocery Products as identified in this document. The Grocery Products must be delivered in a clean and sanitary truck. A lift gate and pallets may be needed for large loads.
6. Deliveries will be accepted during operational hours only. (Schedule to be provided by Food & Nutrition Services)
7. This proposal is for one, two, or three times a week delivery. District will provide start up amounts of products. Bidder will then gauge product usage, set inventory par levels, and supply product as needed on delivery days.
8. A duplicate of the signed invoice ticket shall be left at each location at the time of the delivery. An itemized monthly statement showing each delivery location must be sent to the District's Food and Nutrition Services Department. Quantities, item descriptions, unit prices and extended amounts must be shown on each invoice; this shall apply to all credits(credits must reference original invoice number and date received). The person receiving shall sign invoices and credits.
9. Products to be placed by the driver into specified locations in original cases. Special deliveries may be needed under special circumstances (i.e. equipment failure, theft, etc.) Food & Nutrition Services Central Office, 925-682-8000 x 3775, will call the vendor; identify the site and problem, amount of product needed, and time needed for delivery. If a product is not available through the company awarded the contract, All Grocery Products will be purchased elsewhere.
10. The vendor will be required to maintain a log or report for all products of quantities delivered to the District, (velocity report). Vendor will provide these reports upon request by the District.
11. Delivery days will be Monday through Friday. Same day deliveries are preferred. The delivery driver will report to the designated area at each site as directed by Food & Nutrition Services, Supervisor or Lead Worker. District. Both the delivery driver and each site's point of contact will verify quantities of products delivered. The site point of contact will sign for the delivered quantity only. If a shortage occurs, the site point of contact will line out the printed

quantity and write in the correct quantity on the receipt document. Shortages, if needed, will be filled within a 24 hour period. Missed deliveries and/or shortages of delivery are unacceptable.

12. Central Kitchen, no loading dock and only has parking lot off loading area, trucks must have lift gates, pallets must be no higher than 7 feet tall, they must have floor jacks to deliver inside of the building to designated area/locations as directed by Lead Worker.

13. **Contact for Food Services for substitution of items is: 925-682-8000 ext. 3775**  
Product specifications are based on products and pack sizes currently in use. Alternate pack sizes may be accepted when pack size specified is not available. If proposing an alternate or "generic" item, please quote it in addition to the (brand requested) if possible. In any case, the District will be the sole judge as to whether the products are, in fact, substantially equal to the specifications set forth herein and whether such deviations are acceptable to the District.

14. The successful vendor shall take all necessary precautions as to not damage District premises or property when delivering food items. In case of damage, vendor shall make proper restitutions.

15. **Submission of Written Questions.** All questions about the RFP shall be submitted by e-mail by 2:00 p.m. Pacific Standard Time on or before July 27, 2022 to Diana Engel-Holmes, Ed.D. at [engelholmesd@mdusd.org](mailto:engelholmesd@mdusd.org). The district will provide written responses to questions from prospective Proposers no later than July 29, 2022.

**PRICING:** Due to market fluctuations and budget uncertainties, vendor must give fixed year-round pricing for items noted "year round (YR)" availability. Items marked with monthly availability should be RFP for prices during those months.

**See Excel Spreadsheet on MDUSD website for RFP 1918:**  
<https://mdusd-ca.schoolloop.com/rfp1918groceryproducts>

**Complete pricing and submit with this Proposal.**

Company: The Darnel's Company

Address 4355 Southgate Ct

City, State, Zip Phonix CA 95928

Company Phone No. (710) 895-3187

Company Fax No. (710) 895-3987

Email: Steve@darnelfoods.com

Name (print): STEVEN P. SCHWARTZ

Signature: St P Schwartz

Title of person signing RFP: BID MANAGER

Date: 7.28.22

Terms of Payment: 30 days

% Percent Discount (Net Days): 0



**RENEWAL OPTION  
(To be submitted with proposal)**

If mutually agreeable, the Mt. Diablo Unified School District reserves the right to consider the extension of this contract for three – one year periods for a total contract of 4 years as permitted by law. In the award of this RFP renewal, the District will consider the amount of the price increase stated by the Bidder as a factor and will compute accordingly. A price increase, if exercised, shall be fully justified by the vendor and proved by a test of the marked and/or submission of documents.

Bidder to indicate in space provided if it would accept an option to renew for the following periods and at what percentage.

Dates:	Yes	No	Percentage
07/01/23 to 06/30/24	_____	_____	100%
07/01/24 to 06/30/25	_____	✓	_____
07/01/25 to 06/30/26	_____	✓	_____

The undersigned hereby proposes and agrees to furnish, and deliver the goods and services in accordance with the terms, conditions, specifications and prices herein quoted.

Corporate Seal (If a corporation)

The Schwartz Company  
Proper Name of Individual, Company or Corporation

Steve P. Schwartz  
Authorized Signature (blue ink)

Steven P. Schwartz  
Type or Print Signer's Name

bid manager  
Title

4355 Southgate, Pt Concha CA 95928  
Address, City, State and Zip Code

(930) 895-3187      (700) 895-3987  
Telephone Number      Fax Number

steve@mmrfoods.com  
Email Address

7-28-22  
Date

GROCERY PRODUCTS FOR THE FOOD SERVICE DEPARTMENT

GROCERY BASKET LIST

#	Usage Quantity	Bidders Price Quote	Extended Total	Product Description	Manufacture	Mfg. Item #	Units per Pack	Unit Size	Unit	Net Weight	Notes
1	400	\$ 34.92	\$13,968.00	WHOLE WHEAT BREAD, PACKED 8/20+2 = 160 USABLE SLICED 4/5 OZ., 2 4/5 OZ. SERVINGS = 2.5 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVINGS. CLEAN WITH NO CALCIUM PROPIONATE, NO ARTIFICIAL FLAVORS, OTHER PRESERVATIVES OR UNDERSIRABLE INGREDIENTS OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	SHANNON	SB-500	8	28.8OZ	CS	14.38	Bake Crafters 12-28 oz Actual Extension: 9,312.00
2	475	\$ 31.94	\$15,171.50	51% WHOLE WHEAT 4" BURGER BUN W/HONEY, PACKED 12/12'S = 144/1.8 OZ., 2 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVINGS. CLEAN WITH NO CALCIUM PROPIONATE, NO ARTIFICIAL FLAVORS OR OTHER PRESERVATIVES OR UNDERSIRABLE INGREDIENTS, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	SHANNON	SB-444	144	1.8 OZ	CS	16.2	
3	475	\$ 44.92	\$21,337.00	51% WHOLE WHEAT 6" CLUSTER HOT DOG BUN, 24/8 = 192/1.8 OZ., PROVIDED 2 EQUIVALENT GRAINS BREAD SERVINGS. CLEAN WITH NO CALCIUM PROPIONATE, OR NO ARTIFICIAL FLAVORS OR OTHER PRESERVATIVES, OR UNDERSIRABLE INGREDIENTS OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	SHANNON	SB-960	192	1.8 OZ	CS	21.6	
4	450	\$ 34.63	\$15,583.50	MUFFIN ENGLISH WHOLE GRAIN SLICED, CLEAN INGREDIENT LABEL, FORKSPLIT/SLICED, 51 % WHOLE GRAIN, NO HFCS, NUT FREE, 0 GRAMS TRANS FAT, NO CHOLESTEROL. A GOOD SOURCE OF FIBER AND THIAMIN, PRODUCT CONTAINS 2 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVINGS. CLEAN WITH NO CALCIUM PROPIONATE, NO ARTIFICIAL FLAVORS, NO OTHER PRESERVATIVES OR UNDERSIRABLE INGREDIENTS. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	BURRY	88001	72	2 OZ	CS	9	Bake Crafters 144-2oz Actual Extension: 7,791.75
5	50	\$ 23.60	\$1,180.00	BEAN BLACK, BLACK BEANS, IN BRINE, READY COOKED, REDUCED SODIUM, CLEAN WITH NO UNDESIRABLE INGREDIENTS. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	CASACLS	7486529231	6	#10	CS	43	Our House Market
6	50	\$ 48.23	\$2,411.50	BEAN CHILI PINTO MEXICAN, BEAN CHILI PINTO MEXICAN, HEAT AND SERVE, REDUCED SODIUM, CLEAN WITH NO UNDESIRABLE INGREDIENTS OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	CASACLS	JX-0610	6	#10	CS	40	Market Special Order Allen's
7	50	\$ 45.96	\$2,298.00	BEAN REFRIED VEGETARIAN, 100 % NATURAL, NO PRESERVATIVES, READY COOKED, REDUCED SODIUM, CLEAN WITH NO UNDESIRABLE INGREDIENTS OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	ROSARTA	4430010621	6	10 LB	CS	47.5	
8	50	No Bid	#VALUE!	BEAN WHITE SMALL, BEAN WHITE SMALL, READY COOKED, REDUCED SODIUM, CLEAN WITH NO UNDESIRABLE INGREDIENTS OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	SYS CLS	5204391	6	#10	CS	40	



## GROCERY PRODUCTS FOR THE FOOD SERVICE DEPARTMENT

## GROCERY BASKET LIST

#	Usage Quantity	Bidders Price Quote	Extended Total	Product Description	Manufacture	Mfg. Item #	Units per Pack	Unit Size	Unit	Net Weight	Notes
9	50	\$ 31.04	\$1,552.00	CORN WHOLE KERNEL VACUUM PACK FANCY, CORN WHOLE KERNEL VACUUM PACK FANCY, REDUCED SODIUM, CLEAN WITH NO UNDESIRABLE INGREDIENTS OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT. PICKLE CHIPS, 4/1 GAL., SHELF STABLE UNTIL OPENING AT 34-80F, REFRIGERATE AFTER OPENING. DATE OF MANUFACTURE PRINTED ON CASE AND EACH INDIVIDUAL I.D. PRODUCT CODE THEN JULIAN DATE AND YEAR. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	SYS CLS	F4187613	6	75 OZ	CS	28.1	Our House not Vac Pac not reduced sodium
10	40	\$ 19.62	\$784.80	CEREAL CHEERIO GLUTEN FREE BOWL PACK, PREPORTIONED SERVING FOR CONVENIENCE. CRUNCHY WHOLE-GRAIN TOASTED OAT CEREAL IN RING SHAPED PIECES. PLASTIC PACKAGING, SERVING PROVIDES 1 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVING. NO ARTIFICIAL COLORS OR FLAVORS, EXPIRATION DATE ON PACKAGE. CONTAINS NO MORE THAN 6 GM. ADDED SUGAR PER 1 OZ. EQUIVALENT. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	BLOCK AND BARREL	654BB	4	1 GAL	CS	33	Kruger
11	1350	\$ 23.48	\$31,698.00	CEREAL RICE CHEX GLUTEN FREE BOWL WHOLE GRAIN RICE, CRISPY LATTICE-SHAPED DRY CEREAL, PREPORTIONED, PLASTIC PACKAGING, SERVING PROVIDES 1 OZ. EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVING, CONTAINS NO MORE THAN 6 GM. ADDED SUGAR PER 1 OZ. EQUIVALENT. NO ARTIFICIAL COLORS, FLAVORS, EXPIRATION DATE ON PACKAGE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	GM	16000-32262	96	1 OZ	CS	6	
12	350	\$ 23.48	\$8,218.00	CINNAMON TOASTERS, 96, 1 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVING, WHOLE GRAIN CEREAL WITH NO ARTIFICIAL FLAVORS, OR COLORS FROM ARTIFICIAL SOURCES, CONTAINS NO MORE THAN 6 GM. ADDED SUGAR PER 1 OZ. EQUIVALENT. READY TO EAT. EXPIRATION DATE PRINTED ON PRODUCT. BOWLS ARE INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED PLASTIC, EASY TO SERVE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	GM	31921000	96	1 OZ	CS	6	Special Order
13	2400	\$ 17.87	\$42,888.00	CEREAL FROSTED MINI WHEAT BOWLPAK, 100% WHOLE-GRAIN WHEAT, WHOLE GRAIN FIBER LAYERS WITH A SWEET COATING. PREPORTIONED SERVINGS. PLASTIC PACKAGING, SERVING PROVIDES, SERVING PROVIDES 1 OEQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVING, CONTAINS NO MORE THAN 6 GM. ADDED SUGAR PER 1 OZ. EQUIVALENT. NO ARTIFICIAL COLORS OR FLAVORS, EXPIRATION DATE ON PACKAGE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	MALT O MEAL	3915	96	1 OZ.	CS	6	
14	200	\$ 30.24	\$6,048.00	CEREAL FROSTED SHREDDED WHEAT STRAWBERRY, PREPORTIONED SERVING FOR CONVENIENCE. CRUNCHY WHOLE GRAIN WHEAT, FROSED SHREDDED PILLOWS. PLASTIC PACKAGING, SERVING PROVIDES 2 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVING, CONTAINS NO MORE THAN 6 GM. ADDED SUGAR PER 1 OZ. EQUIVALENT. NO ARTIFICIAL COLORS OR FLAVORS, EXPIRATION DATE ON PACKAGE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	KELLOGG	3800004996	96	1 OZ	CS	6	
15	175	\$ 17.87	\$3,127.25		KELLOGG	27154	48	2 OZ.	CS	6	This product is actually a Malt-O-Meal product

GROCERY PRODUCTS FOR THE FOOD SERVICE DEPARTMENT  
GROCERY BASKET LIST

#	Usage Quantity	Bidders Price Quote	Extended Total	Product Description	Manufacture	Mfg. Item #	Units per Pack	Unit Size	Unit	Net Weight	Notes
16	75	\$ 17.87	\$1,340.25	CEREAL FROSTED SHREDDED WHEAT BLUEBERRY, PREPORTIONED SERVING, CRUNCHY WHOLE-GRAIN WHEAT, FROSED SHREDDED PILLOWS. PLASTIC PACKAGING, SERVING PROVIDES 2 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVING, CONTAINS NO MORE THAN 6 GM. ADDED SUGAR PER 1 OZ. EQUIVALENT., NO ARTIFICIAL COLORS OR FLAVORS. EXPIRATION DATE ON PACKAGE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	KELLOGG	27150	48	2 OZ.	CS	6	This product is actually a Malt-O-Meal product
17	400	\$ 53.40	\$21,360.00	CHEESE AMERICAN 160 SLICE YELLOW, PASTEURIZED, PROCESSED YELLOW AMERICAN CHEESE, 5 # LOAVES PER CASE, AND 160 1/2 OUNCE SLICES PER LOAF. MELTS SMOOTH, CREAMY. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	BBRLCLS	14313	4	5 LB	CS	20	Market Schrieber
18	150	\$ 56.60	\$8,490.00	MILD CHEESE CHEDDAR FEATHER SHREDDED, SHRED SIZE CONSISTENCY ENSURES EVEN MELTING. ANTI-CAKE ADDED TO PREVENT CAKING. BEST BY DD-MMM-YYYY., ALL NATURAL, HIGH QUALITY CHEESE WITH GREAT TASTE AND SUPERB MELTABILITY, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	CASAINP	2921C4	4	5LB	CS	20	Market Lakeview
19	300	\$ 25.90	\$7,770.00	CHEESE CREAM ORIGINAL IN AN INDIVIDUAL POUCH OR CUP, NATURAL CREAM, CHEESE CULTURE, SALT WITHOUT ADDITIVES, (* FULLY CULTURED, FULL-FAT PRODUCT WITH NO PRESERVATIVES OR ARTIFICIAL FLAVORS OR COLORS) OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	PHILA	1.00E+13	100	1 OZ	CS	6.25	Smithfield
20	350	\$ 37.80	\$13,230.00	CHEESE MOZZARELLA STRING, LOW MOISTURE PART SKIM MOZZARELLA CHEESE, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED PORTIONED STICKS FOR EASY SERVICE. RICH DAIRY CHEESE WITH CREAMY TEXTURED AND FIRM BITE FOR ON THE GO SNACKING, 1 EQUIVALENT MEAT/ MEAT ALTERNATIVE SERVINGS. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	BAKER CHEESE	POP-5-CP-25	168	1OZ	CS	10.5	Market Packer Label
21	275	\$ 51.20	\$14,080.00	CHEESE MOZZARELLA WHOLE MILK SHREDDED PREMIUM, PREMIUM MOZZARELLA CHEESE, EXCELLET RE-HEAT PERFORMANCE, AN EVEN MELT, IDEAL FOR TOPPING PIZZA. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	ARZRSVS	1008355	6	5 LB	CS	30	Market actual extension: 21,120.00
22	50	\$ 59.80	\$2,990.00	CHEESE PARMESAN GRATED FRESH, ZIPLOCK BAG, IDEAL FOR TOPPING PIZZA, PASTA AND SALADS. AGED FOR A MINIMUM OF 10 MONTHS FOR ROBUST TASTE. PASTEURIZED. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	REVIEW CHEESE CO.,	605345	4	5LB	CS	20	Market

## GROCERY PRODUCTS FOR THE FOOD SERVICE DEPARTMENT

## GROCERY BASKET LIST

#	Usage Quantity	Bidders Price Quote	Extended Total	Product Description	Manufacture	Mfg. Item #	Units per Pack	Unit Size	Unit	Net Weight	Notes
23	300	MFG Disc	#VALUE!	CHEDDAR CHEESE STICK, 1/W, 168/1 OZ., READY TO SERVE INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, 1 EQUIVALENT MEAT/ MEAT ALTERNATIVE SERVINGS. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	LAND O'LAKES	44881	168	1 OZ.	CS	10.5	
24	275	MFG Disc	#VALUE!	REDUCED FAT COLBY CHEESE STICK, 1/W, 168/1 OZ., READY TO SERVE INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, 1 EQUIVALENT MEAT/ MEAT ALTERNATIVE SERVINGS. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	LAND O'LAKES	44878	168	1 OZ.	CS	10.5	
25	175	\$ 91.50	\$16,012.50	LOL CHEDDAR CHEESE SAUCE, 6/106 OZ., READY TO HEAT AND USE, SHELF STABLE SAUCE, 3 EQUIVALENT MEAT/ MEAT ALTERNATIVE SERVINGS. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	LAND O LAKES	39945	6	106 OZ.	CS	39.75	Market Special Order
26	975	MFG Disc	#VALUE!	BETTER FOR YOU CORNDOG, 72ct., UNCURED CHICKEN FRANK, NO ARTIFICIAL FLAVOR OR COLORING IN 100% WHOLE GRAIN TASTE, NO NITRATES OR NITRATES ADDED, NO ANTIBIOTICS EVER, CN LABELED, EQUIVALENT 2 EQUIVALENT MEAT/ MEAT ALTERNATIVE SERVINGS AND 2 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVINGS. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	FOSTER FARMS	94125	72 CT.	4 OZ.	CS	18	
27	375	\$ 71.03	\$26,636.25	BURRITO, BEAN AND CHEESE, 1/W, MADE WITH COOKED PINTO BEANS, CHEDDAR CHEESE, WHOLE WHEAT FLOUR TORTILLA, SPICES, GARLIC POWDER, SALT, 2 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVINGS, 2 EQUIVALENT MEAT/MEAT ALTERNATIVE SERVINGS OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT	LOS CABOS	93457	96	5.45 OZ.	CS	32.7	Special Order
28	425	\$ 44.36	\$18,853.00	PANCAKE & TURKEY SAUSAGE, ON A STICK, PANCAKE BATTER AROUND A TURKEY SAUSAGE ON A STICK, FULLY COOKED, 72/2.83 OZ., 1 EQUIVALENT MEAT/ MEAT ALTERNATIVE SERVING AND 1.25 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVINGS. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	DON LEE	CNT2833W	72	2.83 OZ.	CS	12.735	
29	225	\$ 15.66	\$3,523.50	CHIP, BULK TORTILLA YELLOW CANTINA, STONE GROUND CORN, WATER, CANOLA OIL, SALT AND TRACE OF LIME, WITH CLEAN INGREDIENTS LABEL. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	MI RANCHO	100879	1	12 LB	CS	12	Aranda's Triangle
30	475	\$ 25.41	\$12,069.75	CHIP TORTILLA, 100 CT, 2.00 OZ., WHOLE GRAIN STONE GROUND CORN, ZERO TRANS FATS, GLUTEN FREE, LOW SODIUM, NO HYDROGENATED OIL. EACH 2 OZ. BAG IS 2 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVINGS. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	RANDA'S TORTILLA CO	AC100-2	100	2 OZ.	CS	14	
31	525	\$ 27.82	\$14,605.50	KETCHUP PACKET, A PREMIUM TOMATO KETCHUP THAT IS MADE WITH SIMPLE HIGH-QUALITY INGREDIENTS FOR A FRESH, TANGY FLAVOR AND CONSISTENCY. NO HIGH FRUCTOSE CORN SYRUP, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	SMPHZNZ	1.00E+13	1000	9GM	CS	20	Special Order

GROCERY PRODUCTS FOR THE FOOD SERVICE DEPARTMENT

GROCERY BASKET LIST

#	Usage Quantity	Bidders Price Quote	Extended Total	Product Description	Manufacture	Mfg. Item #	Units per Pack	Unit Size	Unit	Net Weight	Notes
32	60	\$ 54.95	\$3,297.00	MAYONNAISE HEAVY DUTY, THICK AND CREAMY TEXTURE, WITH GREAT CONSISTENCY, TRADITIONAL OFF-WHITE COLOR AND EGG-BASED TASTE OFFERS A TANGY RICHNESS TO SAUCES, SPREADS AND SPECIALTY DIP RECIPES, READY TO USE, DRY STORAGE ITEM, MANUFACTURED IN THE BOTTLE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	SYS REL	71416SYS	4	1 GAL	CS	29	Market Chef's Pride
33	300	\$ 13.81	\$4,143.00	MAYONNAISE LIGHT REAL PACKET, 200 CT., 7/16 OZ. SAME GREAT MAYONNAISE FLAVOR WITH LOWER FAT AND FEWER CALORIES, SINGLE-SERVE POUCHES, GRAB FOR CARRYOUT AND SELF SERVICE, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	KRAFT	21000665331	200	7/16OZ	CS	5.7	
34	250	\$ 18.27	\$4,567.50	MUSTARD YELLOW PACKETS NATURAL, YELLOW MUSTARD PACKETS, TRADITIONAL RICH TANGY MUSTARD FLAVOR, NO PRESERVATIVES, NO SUGAR ADDED, ARTIFICIAL INGREDIENTS, COLORS OR FLAVORS, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	SMPHZNZ	1.00E+13	500	5.5 GM	CS	6.06	Special Order
35	250	\$ 37.47	\$9,367.50	SAUCE HOT PACKETS, MADE WITH RED PEPPERS, NATURAL SPICES, NO ARTIFICIAL FLAVORS, INGREDIENTS, OR PRESERVATIVES. TAPATIO SALSA PICANTE HOT SAUCE, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	TAPATIO	7.79E+11	500	7 GR	CS	7.7	
36	425	\$ 41.31	\$17,556.75	SAUCE TERYAKI MARINADE AND GLAZE, LOCALLY MADE. CLEAN LABEL, NO MSG, NO PRESERVATIVES, NO HIGH FRUCTOSE SYRUP, LOW IN SODIUM. SOY SAUCE BALANCED WITH SWEETNESS TO CREATE THE IDEAL TERYAKI SAUCE WITH ADDED GINGER. IDEAL AS A GLAZE OR COOKING SAUCE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	NIPPON	223701	6	4.9 LB.	CS	38.25	Market Special Order
37	60	\$ 43.62		ZESTY ORANGE SAUCE, NO HIGH FRUCTOSE CORN SYRUP, READY TO USE. TRADITIONAL SAUCE WITH SWEET TANG OF CITRUS COMPLEMENTED BY GARLIC, SOY, TOASTED SESAME AND GINGER. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	MINORS	11001195	4	5 LB. 6 OZ.	CS	23.5	Special Order Market

GROCERY PRODUCTS FOR THE FOOD SERVICE DEPARTMENT

GROCERY BASKET LIST

#	Usage Quantity	Bidders Price Quote	Extended Total	Product Description	Manufacture	Mfg. Item #	Units per Pack	Unit Size	Unit	Net Weight	Notes
38	150	\$ 13.70	\$2,055.00	DRESSING CAESAR CARDINI PACKET, 60/1.5 OZ. CREAMY CAESAR DRESSING WITH GARLIC, MAYONNAISE BASED, NO MSG, GLUTEN FREE, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	CARDINI	6025	60	1.5 OZ	CS	6.3	
39	500	\$ 11.02	\$5,510.00	DRESSING RANCH BUTTERMILK PACKET, LOW FAT BUTTERMILK RANCH DRESSING EASY TO TEAR PACKETS, DRESSING SHOULD HAVE A TART-TANGY SWEET AND TOASTED ONION FLAVORS, NO MSG, ARTIFICIAL INGREDIENTS, OR ADDITIVES, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	SYS CLS	47020SYS	200	12 GM	CS	6	Fat Free PPI
40	100	\$ 8.29	\$829.00	WATER, SPRING BOTTLED, 100% NATURAL SPRING WATER, NOT JUST FILTERED TAP WATER. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	NIAGARA BOTTLING	NDW80Z80SPPB	80	8 OZ.	CS	18	60-8 oz Crystal Geysler Actual Extension 1,105.33
41	350	No Bid	#VALUE!	WATER PURIFIED .5 LITER, PURIFIED BOTTLED WATER COMES IN THE ECO-SHAPE BOTTLE MADE WITH AN AVERAGE OF 30% LESS PLASTIC AND A SMALLER LABEL TO REDUCE WASTE. PURIFIED WATER GOES THROUGH A MULTISTEP PROCESS OF FILTRATION THAT INVOLVES REVERSE OSMOSIS, BOTTLES MUST BE STURDY ENOUGH TO HOLD AND OPEN. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	PURLIFE	12273782	24	.5 L	CS	28	
42	80	\$ 143.27	\$11,461.60	BEEF BARBACOA, DEL REAL FOODS BEEF BARBACOA, BEEF CHUCK ROASTS, PREPARED, EASY HEAT AND SERVE. CONSISTENT AUTHENTIC FLAVORS AND TEXTURES. CLEAN LABELS, NO MSG, 0 TRANS FAT, GLUTEN FREE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	DELREAL	200	4	5 #	CS	20	Special Order
43	200	\$ 53.43	\$10,686.00	TAMALE RED SAUCE CHICKEN WHOLE GRAIN, DEL REAL FOODS, CHICKEN TAMALE, TAMALE, RED SAUCE, CHICKEN, WHOLE GRAIN, AUTHENTIC FLAVORS AND TEXTURES, HOMEMADE FLAVORS, CLEAN LABELS, NO MSG, 0 TRANS FATS, GLUTEN FREE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	DELREAL	767	12	4CT	CS	15	
44	165	\$ 47.10	\$7,771.50	TORTILLA FLOUR BEAN & CHEESE PUPUSA, DEL REAL FOODS, CHEESE PUPUSA, WHOLE GROUND WHITE CORN MASA FLOUR, AUTHENTIC FLAVORS AND TEXTURES, HOMEMADE FLAVORS, CLEAN LABELS, NO MSG, 0 TRANS FATS, GLUTEN FREE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	DELREAL	124	12	4CT	CS	15	
45	120	\$ 48.93	\$5,871.60	SUN BUTTER SANDWICH ON WHOLE WHEAT BREAD, 96/2.8 OZ. WRAPPED, EACH SANDWICH 1 EQUIVALENT MEAT/MEAT ALTERNATIVE SERVING AND 1.5 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVING. SUNBUTTER IS A DELICIOUS PEANUT AND TREE NUT FREE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	DELREAL	705	8	5 CT	CS	13.76	
46	300	\$ 77.64	\$23,292.00	MUFFIN TOWN	MUFFIN TOWN	12228	96	2.8 OZ	CS	16.8 LB.	

GROCERY PRODUCTS FOR THE FOOD SERVICE DEPARTMENT

GROCERY BASKET LIST

#	Usage Quantity	Bidders Price Quote	Extended Total	Product Description	Manufacture	Mfg. Item #	Units per Pack	Unit Size	Unit	Net Weight	Notes
47	550	\$ 44.78	\$24,629.00	HAM SLICED SMOKED, LOWER SODIUM, 0.5 OZ. SLICES, 6/2 #, TRUE MEAT FLAVOR, CLEANER INGREDIENT STATEMENT, 100% NATURAL, NO PRESERVATIVES, MINIMALLY PROCESSED, NO ARTIFICIAL INGREDIENTS, GLUTEN FREE, NO NITRATES OR NITRITES ADDED EXCEPT FOR THE NATURALLY OCCURRING IN CULTURED CELERY POWDER AND SEA SALT. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	HORMEL FOODS	32225	6	2 LB.	CS	12	Special Order-Smithfield 4-3#
48	200	\$ 89.03	\$17,806.00	TURKEY BREAD SLICED SMOKED .67 OZ. 2/6 LB., SLICED, SMOKED TURKEY BREAD ARRIVES FRESH AND REQUIRE NO THAWING FOR IMMEDIATE USE, CLEAN LABEL, NO ADDITIVES, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT. PEPPERONI NATURAL CHOICE UNCURED, 2/5 LB., 16 SLICES PER OZ., 100% NATURAL, NO PRESERVATIVES, NO ARTIFICIAL INGREDIENTS, MINIMALLY PROCESSED, NO NITRATES OR NITRITES ADDED EXCEPT FOR THOSE NATURALLY OCCURRING IN CELERY JUICE POWDER. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	HORMEL FOODS	72218	2	6 LB.	CS	12	Jennie-O 12-1.5# .5 oz slices Actual extension: 11,870.67 Special Order
49	160	\$ 106.06	\$16,969.60	TOPPING PIZZA SAUSAGE ITALIAN, 2/5 #, FULLY COOKED ITALIAN-STYLE PREMIUM PORK SAUSAGE PIZZA TOPPING, LIGHT BROWN COLOR WITH THE MILD, TASTE OF FENNEL AND GARLIC. ALL MEAT NO EXTENDERS, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	HORMEL FOODS	5262	2	5 LB.	CS	10	25# Bonici Actual extension: 6,787.84
50	140	\$ 29.68	\$4,155.20	IDAHOAN HONEST EARTH CREAMY MASH POTATOES, 8/26 OZ. BAGS PER CASE. CLEAN LABEL, IDAHO POTATOES, BUTTER AND SEA SALT. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	ARREZZIO	68785-071	2	5 LB.	CS	10	Pizzano Special Order
51	45	\$ 47.20	\$2,124.00	COOKIE GRAHAM CHOCOLATE ELF, 150 ct/1 OZ., CHOCOLATE ELF GRAHAM CRACKER COOKIES, READY TO SERVICE CHOCOLATE COVERED BITES OF SWEET, CRUNCH GOODNESS, 1 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVING FOR EACH PORTION. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	IDAHOAN FOODS	2970000713	8	26 OZ.	CS	13	Special Order
52	350	\$ 33.06	\$11,571.00	CRACKER CHEEZ-IT WHOLE GRAIN, WHOLE GRAIN BAKED SNACK CRACKERS, MADE WITH 100% REAL CHEESE, NO ARTIFICIAL FLAVORS OR PRESERVATIVES, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	KEEBLER	3010040239	150	1OZ	CS	9.3	
53	175	\$ 39.64	\$6,937.00	CRACKER GOLDFISH PRETZEL WHOLE GRAIN, WHOLE GRAIN PRETZEL SNACK CRACKERS WITH TRADITIONAL PRETZEL FLAVOR. FUN FISH SHAPES MAKE THESE APPEALING SNACK FOR KIDS. NO ARTIFICIAL FLAVORS OR PRESERVATIVES, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	SUNSHIN	2410079263	175	.75 OZ	CS	8.2	
54	75	\$ 57.98	\$4,348.50	BLUEBERRY LEMON CRISPY BITES, WG IW, 108, 1.0 OZ.SIMPLY WHOLESOME CRISPY BITES HAVE A LIGHT CRUNCH. BITES CONTAIN 8 GRAMS OF WHOLE GRAINS, NATURAL FLAVORS AND NO PRESERVATIVES, 1 GRAIN BREAD EQUIVALENT SERVING, 51 % WHOLE GRAIN FLOUR, NUT-FREE BAKERY, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	PEPFARM	14396	300	.75 OZ	CS	14.06	Market
55	125	\$ 33.82	\$4,227.50		APPLEWAYS	71500	108	1.0 OZ.	CS	8.4	



GROCERY PRODUCTS FOR THE FOOD SERVICE DEPARTMENT  
GROCERY BASKET LIST

#	Usage Quantity	Bidders Price Quote	Extended Total	Product Description	Manufacture	Mfg. Item #	Units per Pack	Unit Size	Unit	Net Weight	Notes
56	1150	\$ 24.33	\$27,979.50	CRACKER GRAHAM HONEY WITH CALCIUM, WHOLE GRAIN, WHEAT FLOUR, SINGLE SERVE PACKAGES, BAKED, SWEET TASTE AND CRUNCHY TEXTURE, EACH PACKAGE PROVIDES 1 GRAIN BREAD EQUIVALENT SERVING, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	KEEBLER	3010091822	150	3 CT	CS	7.31	
57	550	No Bid	#VALUE!	SNACK BAR STRAWBERRY CRISP INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, MADE WITH 51% WHOLE GRAIN, 2.2 EQUIVALENT GRAIN BREAD SERVINGS., GRAIN SERVINGS UNDER THE NSLP GUIDELINES. MINIMUM 250 CALORIES, 2G FIBER, 4G PROTEIN PER BAR. SODIUM NOT TO EXCEED 75MG. MUST BE MADE IN A NUT-FREE FACILITY. SHELF STABLE FOR 6 MONTHS. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	ZEEZEES	B60470	120	2.2 OZ	CS	16.5	
58	400	\$ 18.58	\$7,432.00	BENEFIT BAR, CHOCOLATE-BANANA, MADE WITH 51% WHOLE GRAINS, 0G TRANS FAT, NO ARTIFICIAL COLORS OR FLAVORS NO HYDROGENATED OIL OR HFCS CONTAINS 3 GRAMS OF FIBER LESS THAN 30% CALORIES FROM FAT LESS THAN 10% CALORIES FROM SAT FAT LESS THAN 35% SUGAR BY WEIGHT. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	READIBAKE	40402	48	2.5 OZ.	CS		
59	775	\$ 18.58	\$14,399.50	BENEFIT BAR OAT CHOC CHIP, 48/2.5 OZ., MADE WITH 51% WHOLE GRAINS, 0G TRANS FAT, NO ARTIFICIAL COLORS OR FLAVORS NO HYDROGENATED OIL OR HFCS CONTAINS 3 GRAMS OF FIBER GOOD SOURCE OF CALCIUM LESS THAN 30% CALORIES FROM FAT LESS THAN 10% CALORIES FROM SAT FAT LESS THAN 35% SUGAR BY WEIGHT. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	READIBAKE	40401	48	2.5 OZ.	CS		
60	120	\$ 8.89	\$1,066.80	SEASONING TACO ZESTY, BOLD SOUTH-OF-THE-BORDER TASTE, SEASONING BLEND OF CHILE PEPPERS, GARLIC, ONION, CHILI POWDER, PAPRIKA, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	D'ALLAS	H380A	1	18OZ	CS	1.12	24 oz Tampico 16 oz Tampico Actual Extension 1,145.63
61	20	\$ 6.65	\$133.00	SPICE PEPPER BLACK GROUND, PURE RESEALABLE PLASTIC BOTTLES FOR FRESHNESS AND CONVENIENCE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	IMP/MCC	900010607	6	18 OZ	EA	6.75	
62	75	\$ 30.55	\$2,291.25	SUGAR CONFECTIONERS 10X CANE, 25 LB. BAG, MADE FROM FINE CANE SUGAR MIXED WITH CORN STARCH TO HELP PREVENT CAKING. THE POWDERY CONSISTENCY AND SWEET FLAVOR IS A KEY INGREDIENT IN FROSTINGS, GLAZES, FUDGE AND CANDIES, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	BAKERSOURCE	405590	1	25 LB.	BAG	25	Market 50# Actual extension 1,145.63
63	125	\$ 21.97	\$2,746.25	SUGAR, LIGHT BROWN CANE SUGAR, BRINGS A SWEET, HOMEMADE MOLASSES FLAVOR TO RECIPES FROM BAKED BEANS TO DESSERTS, WHEN ADDED TO BAKED GOODS, THIS LIGHT BROWN SUGAR ENHANCES MOISTNESS AND SHELF LIFE, REDUCING WASTE. READY TO USE, 25 LB. BAG. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	BAKERSOURCE	404347	1	25 LB.	BAG	25	Market

## GROCERY PRODUCTS FOR THE FOOD SERVICE DEPARTMENT

## GROCERY BASKET LIST

#	Usage Quantity	Bidders Price Quote	Extended Total	Product Description	Manufacture	Mfg. Item #	Units per Pack	Unit Size	Unit	Net Weight	Notes
64	160	\$ 18.68	\$2,988.80	SUGAR, GRANULATED, 25 LB., EXTRA FINE GRANULATED CANE SUGAR PROVIDES PURE SWEETNESS WITHOUT AFTERTASTE OR FLAVORINGS. IDEAL FOR BAKING AND COOKING NEEDS. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	SYSCO CLASSIC	401490	1	25 LB.	BAG	25	Market
65	35	\$ 75.47	\$2,641.45	YEAST ACTIVE DRY, DRY YEASTS ARE DRIED UNDER CAREFULLY CONTROLLED CONDITION TO MAINTAIN ACTIVITY. A SPECIFIC STRAIN F SACCHAROMYCES CEREVISIAE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	REDSTAR	15700	12	2 LB	CS	24	Market Special Order Fleischmann's
66	175	\$ 24.44	\$4,277.00	PAN COATING AEROSOL BUTTERCOAT, CANOLA ARECOL COOKING SPRAY WITH ADDED BUTTER FLAVOR, ZERO TRANSFAT PER SERVING. ADDS BUTTER FLAVOR WITHOUT ADDING FAT, STILL PROVIDING NON STICK PERFORMANCE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	PAM	64144-07267	6	17 OZ	CS	6.4	Vegalene Buttery Delight
67	40	\$ 22.73	\$909.20	BLEACH LIQUID GERMICIDAL ULTRA 6%, PACKAGED IN PLASTIC BOTTLES, CONTAINS MANUFACTURED ON DATE IN THE FORMAT JULIAN DATE CODE FORMAT: YEAR(2 DIGITS) JULIAN DAY(3 DIGITS), TIME (2 DIGITS) PLANT IDENTIFIER, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	SYS CLS	11009105041	6	128 OZ	CS	58.5	Market Pure Bright
68	80	\$ 50.99	\$4,079.20	DETERGENT DISHWASHING (LEMON SCENT), PROFESSIONAL POT AND PAN DETERGENT, TOUGH ON GREASE, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	DAWN D	570601/57445	4	1 GAL	CS	35.79	Market Palmolive
69	10	\$ 40.39	\$403.90	COMET CLEANER, POWDER BLEACH CLEANSER IS A POWERFUL OXYGEN BLEACH FORMULA THAT DEEP-CLEANS A VARIETY OF SURFACES WITHOUT LEAVING SCRATCHES OR DAMAGE. IT BREAKS DOWN TOUGH SOILS, SOAP SCUM AND BLEACHABLE STAINS EASILY AND EFFICIENTLY. CUTTING THE AMOUNT OF MANUAL SCRUBBING NEEDED. READY TO USE. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	COMET	520629/32987	24	21 OZ.	CS	33	Market Special Order
70	15	\$ 46.64	\$699.60	POLISH STAINLESS, SPRAY BOTTLE, WATER-BASED, READY TO USE LIQUID, FREE OF SOLVENTS AND MINERAL OIL RICH POLISH, OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	KEYSTONE	6100069	6	32 OZ.	CS	12.32	Market Chase 12-16 oz Special Order
71	15	No Bid	#VALUE!	OVEN CLEANER IN READY TO USE SPRAY BOTTLES, CLINGING GEL FORMULA ELIMINATE MESSY DRIPS AND WASTE, USE ON OVENS, GRILLS, BROILERS, STOVE HOODS AND KITCHEN EQUIPMENT. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	KEYSTONE	6100057	4	32 OZ.	CS	8.99	
72	125	No Bid	#VALUE!	GLOVE NITRILE POTSINK GREEN LARGE, GLOVES PACKAGED ONE PAIR PER BAG, 12-INCH GLOVES, NON-SLIP DIAMOND TEXTURE ON FINGERS AND PALMS. MADE OF FOOD-SAFE NITRILE AND COMPLIANT WITH FDA RULES. OR EQUIVALENT PRODUCT.	HANGARD	303400403	1	12"	CS	2.13	

